
Telford & Wrekin Council has received the following planning applications which require 
publication: 

(format: Application number - Site location - Proposal) 

TWC/2022/0704 – Lightmoor Urban Village, Lightmoor – Variation of Condition 2 of Reserved 
matters application TWC/2018/0518 (layout of Stocking Park including details for access, layout, 
appearance and landscaping pursuant to outline application W2007/0456) to allow changes to the 
play equipment provided 
TWC/2022/0724 – The Stables, Lincoln Hill, Ironbridge – Installation of 1.06m high railings and 
gates to front and side of the property 
TWC/2022/0725 – Short Wood (Hen Rise Woods), New Works Lane, Little Wenlock – Removal of 
Condition 1 (This permission shall be for a period of two years, by which date the use hereby 
permitted shall cease, and the toilet and storage sheds removed from the site) of TWC/2020/0416 
(Change of use of woodland to Forest School and erection of 1no. storage shed and 1no. toilet 
shed) 
TWC/2022/0726 – The Mill Yard, Mill Lane, Kynnersley – Application for a Lawful Development 
Certificate for confirmation works have commenced on granted planning permission 
TWC/2020/0758 (Erection of a single storey side & rear extension and rear orangery to main 
dwelling & two storey side extension to garage/annexe accommodation including replacement 
windows) 
TWC/2022/0728 & TWC/2022/0729 – 27 Chetwynd End, Newport – Erection of a single storey 
rear extension (Retrospective) (Full Planning Application) and Erection of a single storey rear 
extension and removal of an internal wall (Retrospective) (Listed Building Application) 
TWC/2022/0731 – Telford Farm Machinery, Chetwynd End, Newport – Erection of 1no. storage 
marquee (Retrospective) 
 
This notice was published in the Shropshire Star on 8 September 2022 

Would you like more information on a planning application or wish to submit a comment? 

You can view a planning application in more detail and make a comment online. Copy the 
application reference number (TWC/----/----) and go to the planning online website. 

Written representations need to be made by 21 days (18 days for public service infrastructure 
development or 14 days for Permission In Principle applications), excluding public/bank holidays 
and 30 days for applications accompanied by an Environmental Statement) from the date the 
advertisement was published. 

If a written representation appeal is made to the Secretary of State for a householder or minor 
commercial application no further representations can be made and existing representations will 
be forwarded to them. 

https://secure.telford.gov.uk/planning/search-reference.aspx

